
 

 

 

COMHAIRLE    CHONTAE    LIATROMA 
 

 
 

Áras an Chontae 
Carrick on Shannon 

 
Tuesday, 5 March 2024 

 
Cathaoirleach agus Gach Ball of Carrick on Shannon Municipal District, 
COMHAIRLE CHONTAE LIATROMA. 
 
A Chara, 
 
A meeting of Carrick on Shannon Municipal District will take place on Monday, 11 March 
2024 at 10.00 am in the Council Chamber, Áras an Chontae, Carrick-on-Shannon for the 
purpose of transacting the business set out on the Agenda hereunder.  
 
You are hereby invited to attend. 
 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
Kieran Brett 
Meetings Administrator 
Email: kbrett@leitrimcoco.ie 

 
 
 

AGENDA 
  
1.   Adoption of minutes 12th February 2024 (Pages 1 - 44) 

  
2.   Meeting Correspondence  

  
 

Notice of Motions 
  

3.   Motion from Councillor Sean McGowan: 
 
I call on Senior Engineer, Terry McGovern, and District Engineer, Darragh O’Boyle, to  put in 
place a programme of works to carry out the following engineering works in Dromod; 
provide up to four additional street gullies on the left side as you leave the village from old 
Garda Barracks up towards Crowes Garage at the Dromod Beg end of the village; and to 
consider the possibility of providing table top ramps at each entrance into Dromod and one 
in the middle near the entrance to the old Western Meats factory to slow the traffic going 



 

 

through the village.  

  
4.   Motion from Councillor Sean McGowan: 
 
I seek the support of the members in calling on the NTA and the Dept. of Transport to 
immediately provide funding for the provision of a cantilever bridge adjoined to the existing 
road bridge in Roosky.   
  
5.   Motion from Councillor Des Guckian: 
 
That the flooding along the street in Dromod, opposite The Hollies, north of Dromod old 
Barracks, be investigated and alleviated. 
  
6.   Motion from Councillor Des Guckian: 
 
That the unsatisfactory traffic/ pedestrian situation at Rooskey Bridge be addressed by the 
building of a pedestrian cantilever bridge alongside the current bridge and to the southern 
side of it. 
  
7.   Motion from Councillor Finola Armstrong McGuire: 
 
I ask that the housing estate at Tir na Si, Lisnagat here in Carrick is visited and safety 
measures for children playing are implemented by LCC. There are a growing number of 
families now in that area and playing outside should be as safe as possible. I believe there 
are improvements that could be made for safety of all. 
  
8.   Motion from Councillor Finola Armstrong McGuire: 
 
I ask that the road surface at the top of Summerhill, turning to the Community school road 
and secondly, the point of turning for Ayrfield Manor from same road, is examined and 
repaired as part of the Easter holiday time improvements on Summerhill. Temporary fill has 
been used here and the action of vehicles turning is continuously loosening the chippings 
that have been used. 
  
9.   Motion from Councillor Thomas Mulligan 
 
I ask that the footpaths in Mohill, other than Main Street, receive power sweeping / power 
washing. 
  
10.   Motion from Councillor Thomas Mulligan 
 
I ask that Local Road L-1572 in the townlands of Drumgrainne and Anskirt be included for a 
strengthening grant between Moffitt’s Cross and Gortlettragh GAA grounds.  There is a 
safety issue at Moffitt’s Cross regarding the view when moving onto the Gortlettragh / 
Farnaght road L-1571. 
  



 

 

11.   Motion from Councillor Paddy Farrell: 
 
I call on District Engineer Darragh O’Boyle to give an update on when work and 
improvements will be carried out on the road from Killnagross to Churchpark L3409. 
  
12.   Motion from Councillor Paddy Farrell: 
 
I ask Leitrim County Council to examine and remove, if necessary, the trees in Amber Court, 
along the Oaklands Estate in Summerhill, Carrick-on-Shannon, as they pose a danger to 
overhead wires if they are impacted by a storm. 
  
13.   Motion from Councillor Enda Stenson 
 
I call for a re-vamp of the housing block at Hyde Terrace Mohill. We need to ask for funding 
from the Department of Housing to complete this action.  
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